
BID TABULATION
Jones GolfCourse Grass Seed Mix

Bid #PUR0918-052

September 19, 2018 at 3:00 pm

Line Item Description

Unit Price 

Per Pound

Extended 

Price

Unit Price 

Per Pound

Extended 

Price

Unit Price 

Per Pound

Extended 

Price

Unit Price 

Per Pound

Extended 

Price

1

70/30 Grass Seed Mix as specified in the bid 

documents, price per pound for 

appoximately 3000 pounds No Bid No Bid $2.18 $6,540.00

Custom 

$2.54 $7,620.00 $2.53 $7,590.00

2

50/50 Grass Seed Mix as specified in the bid 

documents, price per pound for 

appoximately 3000 pounds No Bid No Bid $1.79 $5,370.00

Custom 

$2.19 $6,570.00 $2.23 $6,690.00

Write In Option:

Write In Pricing $2.20 $6,600.00 $2.19 $6,570.00

Normal packaging size:

Price per package of seed

Description of seed mix provided?

Warranty:

How long pricing is held for:

Estimated delivery time upon receipt of 

purchase order:

Signature Page

1 Do You Accept Credit Card for Payment?

2 Quick Pay Discount

3 Does Discount Apply to MasterCard?

50# bag

$110.00

Yes Yes

$109.00 for 70/30, 

$89.50 for 50/50

50 lb Bag

VENDORS

Vendor Location

Local Business Certificate on File (Yes/No)

Big Country Seeds

Tiffin, IA

No

United Seeds Inc.

Des Moines, IA

No

River City Turf

Silvis, IL

No

Instock Grand Slam 50/50 

mix

Custom blends are 500 lb 

minimum

12/31/2018

4 days

N/A

N/A

N/A

2-3 days for Custom; 1-2 

days for Grand Slam 50/50 

mix

No

N/A

day bid received

N/A

Yes

50 pound bags

70/30 $126.50,

50/50 $111.50

Yes

No warranty on seed

60 days

D&K Products

Cedar Rapids, IA

Yes

12 months

24 hours

Yes

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

Yes

60/40 Seed Mix

50 lb

$129.00 for 70/30 custom,

 $109.50 for 50/50 custom,

 $109.50 for Grand Slam 

50/50 mix

12 months


